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Raj Infotech laptop Repairing - Panipat
   
Discover Raj Infotech: Your Go-To Electronics Store in Panipat, Haryana

  Raj Infotech is a leading **electronics store** located in the heart of Panipat,
Haryana. Specializing in laptop repairing and offering a wide range of **service
options**, this store has garnered various reviews from satisfied customers.
Whether you need a quick fix or comprehensive service, Raj Infotech aims to
meet your electronics needs.  

Exceptional Service Options for All Your Electronics Needs

  At Raj Infotech, customers have praised the **excellent knowledge** displayed
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by the technicians regarding all types of laptops and desktops. With **same-day
delivery** on many repairs, you can quickly get your device back in working
order. The store offers **in-store pick-up** for those who prefer to collect their
devices personally, ensuring convenience and efficiency.  

Affordable and Reliable Laptop Repairing

  Many patrons have commented on the **good laptop repairing** services
provided at **low costs**. While some reviews mention that certain services
might be a bit pricey, the overall quality of work remains commendable. The
specialists are adept at **hdd data recovery**, making it a trusted spot for those
facing data loss issues.  

Modern Payment Solutions for Convenience

  Raj Infotech understands the importance of convenient payment methods. The
store accepts various forms of payments, including traditional cash and **NFC
mobile payments**. This flexibility makes transactions swift and hassle-free,
allowing you to focus on getting your electronics repaired without any undue
stress.  

Sustainable Practices: Recycling Your Electronics

  In addition to their repair services, Raj Infotech promotes **recycling** of old
electronics. This initiative not only helps reduce electronic waste but also
encourages a sustainable approach to technology usage. Customers looking to
dispose of outdated gadgets can do so responsibly at this store.  

Planning Your Visit to Raj Infotech

  If you're considering a visit, keep in mind that a **quick visit** can go a long
way in resolving your electronics issues. The store's efficient service guarantees
that you won't have to wait long, making it an ideal choice for those with busy
schedules.   In conclusion, Raj Infotech stands out as a reliable electronics store
in Panipat, combining expertise, affordability, and commitment to customer
satisfaction. With various **service options**, modern payment methods, and a
focus on sustainability, it's a destination worth visiting for all your electronics
needs.    
The location of our business is in

  
 Azad Nagar Rd, 132103  Panipat, Haryana - India  (IN) 
 
         
 
   
    
 

We are available at these times:

    Day Hours    Monday
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