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Aastha Computers - Panipat
   
Discover Aastha Computers: Your One-Stop Computer Store in Panipat,
Haryana

  Aastha Computers has established itself as a reliable hub for various
computer-related services in Model Town, Panipat. From NFC mobile payments
to exceptional print services, this computer store caters to a wide range of
customer needs.  

NFC Mobile Payments for Hassle-Free Transactions

  In today’s digital age, convenience is key. Aastha Computers embraces
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modern technology by offering **NFC mobile payments**. This feature allows
customers to settle their bills swiftly and securely, making transactions
seamless. Whether you're printing documents or paying online bills, the ease of
**mobile payments** enhances your overall experience at the store.  

Services Offered at Aastha Computers

  Customers have shared a variety of experiences regarding the services
available at Aastha Computers. Notable mentions include:  - **Printing and
Photocopying**: The store is widely recognized for providing high-quality
printing services and photocopying, making it an ideal choice for students and
professionals alike. Users appreciate the **good quality of every document**
produced, ensuring satisfaction with every visit.  - **Online Bill Payments**:
Aastha Computers offers the facility for paying online bills, allowing locals to
handle their payments without hassle.  - **Binding Services**: Many customers
have availed services like **spiral binding**, adding to the diverse offerings that
cater to different requirements.  

Customer Feedback: The Good and the Not-So-Good

  While Aastha Computers is praised for its services, feedback reveals a mix of
positive and constructive comments:  - **Positive Experiences**: Customers
frequently mention that it's a "good cyber cafe" with **reasonable charges** for
services rendered. Many in Model Town consistently rely on Aastha Computers
for their computing needs.  - **Communication and Pricing**: Reviewers
highlight the friendly communication from the staff and note that the prices are
often competitive. However, some customers caution about the possibility of
being charged more than expected, indicating the importance of clarity before
proceeding with services.  - **Areas for Improvement**: Some customers have
pointed out concerns regarding the owner’s behavior, suggesting that
improvements in customer service could enhance the overall experience.   

Conclusion

  Aastha Computers stands out as a vital resource for Model Town’s community,
providing a suite of essential services, including printing, photocopying, and
modern payment options like NFC mobile payments. While there are areas to
improve, such as customer interaction, the store remains a favored destination
among locals. With its commitment to quality and service, Aastha Computers
continues to be a significant player in Panipat’s computer service landscape.    
You can reach us at

  
 Aastha Computers, Old Gas Godown, 495 L, 132103  Panipat, Haryana - India  (IN) 
 
     
 
The contact phone of this Computer store  is +917027512182
 
And if you want to send a WhatsApp, you can do so at+917027512182
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Our business hours are:

    Day Hours    Monday 9?AM–10?PM   Tuesday 9?AM–10?PM   Wednesday Closed   Thursday 9?AM–10?PM   Friday 9?AM–10?PM   Saturday 9?AM–10?PM   Sunday 9?AM–10?PM           If you need to adjust any detail that you feel is not correct regarding this
web, we urge you to send us a message so we can we will adjust it quickly.
Thanks beforehand thanks. 
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