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Welcome to Constek IT Solutions: Your One-Stop Computer Store in
Amravati

  At **Constek IT Solutions**, we take pride in being the leading computer store
in Amravati, Maharashtra. Our extensive offerings include a wide range of
electronics, particularly focused on CCTV systems such as the True View and
CP Plus cameras.   
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Quality Products at Affordable Prices

  Our customers consistently highlight the **quality of our products** and
services. From CCTV installations to various other electronic items, we ensure
that you receive the best quality at competitive prices. As one customer noted,
"The quality of products and service is best." With us, you can trust that you're
investing in reliable technology.  

Exceptional Repair Services and Quick Visit Options

  We've received numerous positive reviews regarding our **repair services**.
Our experienced staff is always ready to assist with any issues that may arise
after your purchase. As one satisfied customer stated, "After sales service is
amazing; they are just a phone call away." Whether you need consultation for a
new product or require immediate assistance, our quick visit options make it
convenient for you to get the help you need.  

Accessibility and Amenities

  At Constek IT Solutions, we prioritize **accessibility** for all our customers.
Our store features **wheelchair-accessible seating**, ensuring that everyone
can comfortably explore our offerings. Additionally, we provide complimentary
**Wi-Fi** for an enhanced shopping experience.  

Flexible Payment Options

  We understand the importance of convenient payment methods. That's why
we offer several **payment options** including **Google Pay**, cash, and
cheques for your convenience. Please note that some transactions may be cash
only, so plan accordingly during your visit.  

Easy Online Appointments and In-Store Pick-Up

  For those who prefer planning ahead, we offer **online appointments** for
consultations and product inquiries. You can also choose to utilize our **in-store
pick-up** option for added convenience. This allows you to shop at your leisure
and avoid long wait times.  

Commitment to Recycling and Sustainability

  Constek IT Solutions is committed to **recycling** and sustainability. We
encourage our customers to recycle their old electronics, promoting an
eco-friendly solution in the tech industry.   

Why Choose Constek IT Solutions?

  Our track record speaks for itself. Customers recommend us for our friendly,
supportive service and **assembly service** that gets your products up and
running in no time. As one repeat buyer mentioned, "Hassle-free installation and
the product is ready to use in no time." Our technical team is well-trained and
equipped to guide you through every step, from selection to after-sales support. 
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In summary, if you're looking for a reliable computer store in Amravati for your
electronics needs, visit **Constek IT Solutions** today. We're here to provide
you with exceptional service and high-quality products that meet all your IT
requirements.    
You can visit us at the address:

  
 75, VMV Rd, 444604  Amravati, Maharashtra - India  (IN) 
 
     
 
The contact line of said Computer store  is +919860132545
 
And if you want to send a WhatsApp, you can do so at+919860132545
 
    
 
   
    
 

We open at the following schedule:

    Day Hours    Monday 7?AM–11?PM   Tuesday 7?AM–11?PM   Wednesday 7?AM–11?PM   Thursday 7?AM–11?PM   Friday 7?AM–11?PM   Saturday 7?AM–11?PM   Sunday 7?AM–11?PM           In case you want to adjust any element that you believe is not accurate
about this portal, we ask deliver a message and we will handle it promptly. With
anticipation thanks for your cooperation. 

Images
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