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Welcome to Skynet Computers: Your Go-To Computer Software Store in
Rewari, Haryana

  Skynet Computers is a **women-owned business** that understands the
importance of reliable technology in today’s fast-paced world. Located in
Rewari, this store provides an array of computer software and repair services
tailored to meet your needs.  

Our Offerings

  At Skynet Computers, we offer a variety of **repair services** for both laptops
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and desktop computers. Whether you are dealing with hardware issues or
software malfunctions, our expert team is here to help. From virus removal to
system upgrades, we are dedicated to ensuring your devices run smoothly.  

Convenient Service Options

  We know that time is precious. That’s why we provide multiple **service
options** to facilitate your experience:  - **Online Appointments:** Book your
repairs ahead of time through our easy-to-use online appointment system. -
**In-store Pick-Up:** If you need a quick visit, drop by our store for immediate
assistance. - **Delivery Services:** We offer delivery for customers who prefer
to have their devices picked up or dropped off at their convenience.  

Flexible Payment Methods

  To make your shopping experience seamless, we accept various payment
methods including **Google Pay**, cheques, and **NFC mobile payments**.
You can choose whichever option suits you best.  

Customer Feedback

  Our customers love us! Here’s what some have to say:  - “I will recommend
this store. The owner's behavior was so nice.” - “Great service at reasonable
prices. Awesome and speedy work!” - “Few days ago I bought a Dell laptop. It's
fabulous, and the owner is very good.”  We always appreciate feedback from
our customers and strive to improve our services based on your suggestions.   

Improving Our Services

  We value insights from students and clients alike. One suggestion that has
come up is the inclusion of a **projector** for better learning during tech
courses. Your input helps us enhance our offerings!  

Visit Us Today!

  If you're facing any issues with your computer or laptop, do not hesitate to visit
**Skynet Computers**. With excellent service on time and a commitment to
customer satisfaction, we guarantee you won’t be disappointed. Remember, an
**appointment is required** for certain services, so booking online is
recommended.  Discover why we are considered the **best shop** in the area.
Experience exceptional service and quality at Skynet Computers!    
You can reach us at

  
 Shop no 460, shopping complex, Old Ct Rd, 123401  Rewari, Haryana - India  (IN) 
 
     
 
The contact line of the mentioned Computer software store  is +919728899944
 
And if you want to send a WhatsApp, you can do so at+919728899944
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Our service hours are:

    Day Hours    Monday 9?AM–8?PM   Tuesday 9?AM–8?PM   Wednesday 9?AM–8?PM   Thursday 9?AM–8?PM   Friday 9?AM–8?PM   Saturday 9?AM–8?PM   Sunday 10?AM–1?PM           In case you want to alter any detail that you consider is not accurate about
this page, we urge you to send us a message so we can we will fix it at the
earliest convenience. Thanks beforehand thanks for your cooperation. 
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